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HOME – MEDIA - Amor à Vida – and the Brands 

 
Prime-time novela ends with a long list of advertisers who took advantage of its 

chapters to display merchandising actions 
 
Bárbara Sacchitiello 

January 31, 2014 - 3:45 AM 
 

The redemption of the villain Félix, the settling of scores between César and his 
wife, Aline, the happy family life of Paloma, Bruno, and Paulinha. These are some 
of the outcomes that the audience will follow this Friday, the 31st, in the last 

chapter of Amor à Vida. 
 

The plot by Walcyr Carrasco, which aired in May 2013, managed to maintain a 
good audience rating, especially in its final chapters. This Monday, the 27th, the 
revelation of the real plans of the villain , Aline, caused the plot to peak at 50 

audience points in Greater São Paulo, consolidating an average of 45 points. 
 

With great repercussion on social networks, the plot was, for several weeks, the 
most commented TV program on TTV, a weekly ranking elaborated by the 
company Tuilux. The comments, however, were divided between those who 

praised the scenes and the performance of some actors and those who criticized 
some seemingly inconsistent and off-purpose scenes. 
 

The good audience and strong repercussion also yielded the novela a good 
commercial performance. Several advertisers inserted their products into the plot's 

chapters, such as Itaú, Kia, and Nextel, among many others. The fictional hospital 
San Magno, where several of the novela's most important scenes took place, had 
the Casa do Pão de Queijo in its food area. In the same hospital environment, 

Natura carried out one of its plot actions, promoting a makeup workshop for 
cancer patients. 

 
Other plot events also stood out. To showcase the models of its Grendene line, 
singer Anitta made a special appearance in the novela, performing a  small show 

at the bar frequented by doctors and hospital staff. Real estate broker Bruno, 
played by Malvino Salvador, used Zap Imóveis to improve his workflow and 

facilitate contacts with clients. And lawyer Rafael (portrayed by actor Rainer 
Cadete), in an attempt to encourage the character Linda (Bruna Linzmeyer) in 
contact with people, shaved his beard using a Gillette (P&G) device. 

 
Amor à Vida also made room for movie merchandising – The Wolverine and 

Flores Raras are some examples - and for Globo's own programming. Scenes 
where characters were sitting on the couch, commenting on some novela, news 
program, or broadcaster's attraction, were common. 

 
"I'm reading this book" 

Another campaign caught the attention of Amor à Vida's viewers. In an attempt to 
encourage reading in the country, author Walcyr Carrasco wrote several scenes in 
which the characters were seen reading various books. Recommendations of 

works and the number of books mentioned in the chapters garnered various 
comments - and also some criticism - on social networks. 

 
Valdirene in BBB 
The biggest cross-content action within the novela, however, was the participation 



of the character Valdirene (Tatá Werneck) in Big Brother Brazil. 

 
In a cross-content that lasted several chapters, the character fought to enter the 

house, was confined in a glass house until finally entering the reality show. 
 
Valdirene remained in the house for only 12 hours, where she interacted with all 

the participants, causing discussions and hilarious moments, which were shown 
both in the novela and in BBB itself. For the actress's exit from the house, Globo 

invented a fictitious surprise test, in which Tatá's character was eliminated. 
 
  



 


